DAV20324 S.L.C.

116TH CONGRESS
2D SESSION S.

Mr.

(o BN e VY B R VS I 8]

To restore military priorities, and for other purposes.

IN THE SENATE OF THE UNITED STATES

DUurBIN (for himself, Mr. LEany, Mr. REED, Ms. DuckworTi, Mr.
JONES, Ms. BALDWIN, Mr. MURPIrY, Mr. BLUMENTHAL, Mrs. MURRAY,
Mr. TESTER, Mrs. FEINSTEIN, Mr. CASEY, Mr. WHITEHOUSE, Mr.
MENENDEZ, Mr. WARNER, Mr. WYDEN, Mr. SCHATZ, Mr. SANDERS, Mr.
CArDIN, Mr. UpALL, Mr. BENXNET, Ms. KLOBUCHAR, Mrs. SHAHEEN,
Ms. Correz Masto, Mr. KaINE, Ms. HassaN, Mr. CARPER, Mr. VAN
HorLrLeN, Mr. BoOKER, Mr. BRowN, Ms. HiroNO, and Mr. COONS) in-
troduced the following bill; which was read twice and referred to the Com-
mittee on

A BILL

To restore military priorities, and for other purposes.

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-
twes of the United States of America in Congress assembled,
SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE.

This Act may be cited as the “Restoring Military Pri-
orities Act of 2020”.

SEC. 2. RESTORATION OF REPROGRAMMED FUNDS.
All amounts transferred under the Department of

Defense reprogramming action FY 20-01 RA, “Support

DV3 LJ SV2



DAV20324 S.L.C.

O o0 N N W Bk W =

e T e S e e S e S T = T
o N O W»n kA W NN = O

2

for DIIS Counter-Drug Activity Reprogramming Action”,
shall be restored to the appropriation accounts and the
programs, projects, and activities for which such amounts
were appropriated or otherwise made available by the De-
partment of Defense Appropriations Act, 2020 (division
A of Public Law 116-93).

SEC. 3. LIMITATION ON GENERAL TRANSFER AUTHORITY.

Section 8005 of the Department of Defense Appro-
priations Act, 2020 (division A of Public Law 116-93; )
is amended by striking “$4,000,000,000” and inserting
“$1,798,000,000”.

SEC. 4. LIMITATION ON OVERSEAS CONTINGENCY OPER-
ATIONS/GLOBAL WAR ON TERRORISM TRANS-
FER AUTHORITY.

Section 9002 of the Department of Defense Appro-
priations Act, 2020 (division A of Public Law 116-93; )
is amended by striking “$2,000,000,000” and inserting
“$371,000,000".

DV3 LJ SV2



